Chapter Discussions for 2008 Funding disbursal
This document captures the meeting notes and e-mail discussions on ashaprinceton@googlegroups.com regarding Anu and Krishna’s fellowship disbursal for the year 2008.

A.  January, 10, 2008.  Message from Krishna regarding 2008 Fellowship.

Dear Sridhar and Priya

Greetings from Sittilingi and wish you both a very Happy New Year.

We spoke to Regi regarding our fellowship for the next year and he says that Tribal Health Initiative would continue to route our fellowships. So the present arrangement can stand.

Regi has also been pressing us to increase our fellowships amounts for a while now as we havent made any changes in our income for the past 4 years. The exception is that last year we joined the PF scheme at THI as it was a convenient way for us to save some money from our income. This meant a 12 percent contribution from THI into our PF account.

we have been giving it a thought, also since you too mentioned this when you were here Sridhar, and have now decided that we would like an increase given our increasing expenses.So could you all discuss this at Asha Princeton and decide how much more you would be able to contribute to the Fellowship amount?

We just received a nice mail from Sriranjani regarding your plans of shifting and are really looking forward to seeing you all soon here.

Priya, hope you too would visit us next time you come to India so that we can get better acquainted. Till then, all the very best for your activities with Asha Princeton and wish that the New Year brings you all peace and happiness.

Looking forward to hearing from you all.

With Warm Regards

Anu and Krishna
B.  January 16, 2008.  Reply from Priya to Krishna

Dear Anu and Krishna - Happy New Year to you too!

We discussed about the general increase in fellowship and about the PF amount in our meeting last Saturday. There should be no problem increasing the Fellowship amount to cover both these items. Also, as Sridhar mentions below, please send the details about the additional items. 

I will definitely try to visit you during my next trip to India. 

Regards,

Priya

C.  Meeting Notes from March 15th meeting shared by Sowmya (awaiting actual minutes) 

On 3/22/08, Sowmya Karthikeyan <sowmya.karthikeyan@gmail.com> wrote:

> one more item

>

> 6. we would like to receive renewal proposal and approve amount in INR

> instead of USD.

>

> Sowmya

>

>

> On Sat, Mar 22, 2008 at 11:14 AM, Sowmya Karthikeyan wrote:

> > Hi Sridhar,

> >

> >  I guess Priya can elaborate, but here is a brief description of what

> >  we discussed:

> >

> >  1. Priya talked about an increase in fellowship amount to allow for

> >  cost of living increases. We decided on a 5% per year applied to the

> >  last proposal amount, compounded annually to arrive at the next annual

> >  fellowship amount.

> >

> >  2. The subject of contributing to the Provident Fund was brought up.

> >  It was decided that Asha will support their current efforts and not

> >  try to contribute towards their future efforts. So, we may

> >  appropriately increase the fellowship amount (keeping any ceiling

> >  necessary for tax purposes).

> >

> >  3. Additional expenses for books, stationery, teaching materials that

> >  they have been paying out of their pocket - we would contribute

> >  towards those expenses, again in one lump sum fellowship amount. This

> >  is if they are spending a little bit throughout the year. However, if

> >  they are to develop a library of sort, and they would need to purchase

> >  a lot of books at one time, they could send us another itemized

> >  proposal just for that. Asha-Princeton is favorable to agree to fund

> >  that  effort. Hansa suggested that Asha has a relationship with a

> >  publisher of textbooks who can provide those books at a discount.

> >

> >  4. Priya agreed to run the numbers for the new amount for fellowship

> >  and email us. She would be contacting you to get a new proposal

> >  request ready - with the new numbers which we will immediately approve

> >  and disburse funds.

> >

> >  5. Hansa agreed to follow up with the possibility of getting discount

> books.

> >

> >  Hopefully, I have covered most of the discussions. Amrish, Priya,

> >  please add to this if I have missed something.

> >

> >  Sowmya

> >

D.  March 31, 2008:  Communication on ashaprinceton@googlegroups.com
Sridhar -

As Sowmya mentioned, it was decided that Asha Princeton will support their current efforts and not try to contribute towards their future efforts (a.k.a PF)

Also, this is the first time I am hearing about the topic of paying arrears. We will discuss it in the next meeting and follow up with the additional funds if it gets approved. 

Please refer to : http://spreadsheets.google.com/pub?key=pVn5UG-nnr6eEWJ9OlDNQDQ for my calculations for 2008 funding.

I would have liked to gain consensus in our last meeting regarding funds disbursements but the attendance was poor (only Amrish, myself and one new person). Since we can't afford to wait till we meet again to decide on this, I am hoping to get approval from everyone for Rs. 2 lakh by email. 

Meanwhile, can you please ask them to prepare a proposal requesting Rs. 2 Lakhs. As soon as the amount is finalized from our end, we can ask them to update the amount in the proposal, if necessary.

Asha Princeton Volunteers -

The amount in Rupees that we would like to approve for Anu and Krishna Fellowship is Rs. 2 lakhs. Supporting calculations are available at http://spreadsheets.google.com/pub?key=pVn5UG-nnr6eEWJ9OlDNQDQ 

As soon as I hear from our currently active members (Amrish, Sowmya, Sohail, Hansa, Ravi and Kavitha), I will request Sowmya to send out the funds. 

Regards,

Priya

On Sat, Mar 29, 2008 Sridhar Desikan wrote:

Friends,

I did not know that income tax was one of the issues holding up disbursal of funds for Anu and Krishna (were minutes of the meeting where this was discussed posted?).  Currently they have not received *any* salary for the month of April.  Please keep in mind that it takes some time for the funds to actually reach here for their use.

I will be visiting Sittilingi next week and would appreciate if this is addressed before that so I can communicate it to them.

Thanks

Sridhar

E.  April 1, 2008:  Communication on ashaprinceton@googlegroups.com
Hi Priya:

Thanks for the message.

I had proposed a 5% increase in their fellowship amount to cover for the rate of inflation (it stands at 6.8% in India now), so at least their real wages would remain approximately the same.  Their fellowship amount has remained the same between 2004 and 2006, with just  a $100 increase in 2007.   The arrears amount can be given later after chapter discussions if it was not brought up this time.

I looked through your calculations. Actual fellowship amount we started out with was $4200 ($2100 each for Anu and Krishna).  For some reason only $4100 was sent in 2004, so we adjusted that by sending $4300 in 2005.  So, the funding was $4200 in 2004, $4200 in 2005, $4200 in 2006, and $4400 in 2007 (a $100 increase each).  I have recalculated their 2008 fellowship amount based on 5% annual rate of inflation.  Without taking arrears into account, the amout comes to Rs. 2.19 lakhs (please see attached).  Ideally, we should adjust for dollar devaluation as well, but this is something we will have to discuss further.  As you know USD has come down from Rs. 44 to Rs. 39, a 12% decline.

Regarding proposals, unlike projects where we request for a proposal under each budget item, for fellowships we do not require written proposals.  Their work is their proposal.  If Asha Princeton volunteers are interested, I can facilitate a teleconference with them while I am there this weekend.  

Sowmya, I have attached the checklist from 2007 for your convenience.  Please request this as soon as the chapter voting is completed.  I don't think online transfer from ICICI to SBI at Kottapatti can be done (we had some issues last year), so you (or Priya) may have to receive the check to your address and mail the check to their address on the checklist.  Let me know if you have any questions on this.

Best Regards,

Sridhar

F.  April 1, 2008:  Communication on ashaprinceton@googlegroups.com
Before we can request disbursal of funds, we need

(1) chapter to approve amount

(2) an updated version of the Checklist document that Sridhar provided

- reflecting the new funding amount

(3) updated renewal request/proposal reflecting the funding amount

(4) amount and document updated to project website.

For fellowships, we do NOT need itemized funding information or detailed budget.

But what we need is an updated proposal document. Last year the

funding was approved without a renewal proposal - may be it is OK to

do that again, but we have been urged by the Asha-wide treasury team

to have an updated document placed in the website so that anyone can

go up and look why the chapter sent the money they sent.

For fellowships, this document doesn't have to include any

calculations, discussion or reasons for why the amount was increased

etc. even though the chapter may discuss this. Chapter discussions

would be in meeting minutes.

I fully understand that we are behind schedule and how this would

affect Anu and Krishna and hope this can be resolved ASAP. Please note

that I am not trying to make things harder or introduce additional

delay by asking for documentation. I am just trying to follow the

procedure as far as requesting Asha-wide treasurer to disburse funds.

Everyone, please email your availability for conf call. Please provide

multiple time slots and let us arrange one when we can have most

participants.

I am available:

Thursday 7:30 pm - 10:00 pm Eastern time

Friday 7:00 pm - 10:00 pm Eastern time

Saturday and Sunday - I am traveling, but can try to call in depending

on cell signal - 9 am to 9 pm.

Sowmya

G.  April 3, 2008:  Discussion on ashaprinceton@googlegroups.com
Thanks Sowmya.

Updated spreadsheet:

http://spreadsheets.google.com/pub?key=pVn5UG-nnr6eEWJ9OlDNQDQ

Regards,

Priya

- Hide quoted text -

On Thu, Apr 3, 2008 Sowmya Karthikeyan wrote:

Here are some historic exchange rates from http://www.x-rates.com

Used April averages for each year - since we usually send money out in April.

2004 - Rs 45

2005 - Rs 43

2006 - Rs 45

2007 - Rs 42

Please use these in your conversion table.

Thanks

Sowmya

On Thu, Apr 3, 2008 Priya Nallan wrote:

> Good point. I don't know the exchange rate that was used as a guideline in

> the past years so I have updated the notes below for the 2008 disbursement.

> Additional details are in the spreadsheet.

>

>

> Asha Princeton has disbursed $4200 for years 2004, 2005 and 2006. Last year,

> the funding was increased by $200 ($100 each) totalling to $4400

> Decision was made to take into account inflation (5% each year) and fund

> this year using this inflation adjusted amount

> The amount requiring your approval for 2008 disbursement is $5125 -> Rs.

> 2,05,000

>

> Reference for calculations:

> http://spreadsheets.google.com/pub?key=pVn5UG-nnr6eEWJ9OlDNQDQ

>

> Regards,

> Priya

> On Thu, Apr 3, 2008 HS wrote:

>

> > Hi Priya,

> >

> >

> > Can you help us make an apples to apples comparison by giving amounts

> disbursed in rupees and also dollars, and amount requested also in rupees

> and dollars.

> >

> >

> > Thanks

> > H

> >

> > On Thu, Apr 3, 2008 Priya Nallan wrote:

> >

> > >

> > >

> > > Here is a quick summary of the Anu and Krishna Fellowship funding:

> > >

> > > We are behind schedule to approve Anu and Krishna Fellowship funding. So

> instead of waiting for the next Chapter meeting, we will vote for funding

> approval on the conf call on Thurs at 8pm EST

> > > Asha Princeton has disbursed $4200 for years 2004, 2005 and 2006. Last

> year, the funding was increased by $200 ($100 each) totalling to $4400

> > > Decision was made to take into account inflation (5% each year) and fund

> this year using this inflation adjusted amount

> > > The amount requiring your approval for 2008 disbursement is Rs. 2,05,000

> > > Reference for calculations:

> > > http://spreadsheets.google.com/pub?key=pVn5UG-nnr6eEWJ9OlDNQDQ

> > >Here is a quick summary of the Anu and Krishna Fellowship funding:

H.  April 5, 2008

The amount approved for Anu and Krishna Fellowship funding for 2008 is Rs. 2.3 lakhs.

Background:

There are 2 variables that is affecting our actual contibution to fellows: inflation and dollar exchange rate. We addressed the inflation by agreeing to set it at 5% for each year for the dollar contributions. However, because of the dollar devaluation, the increases applied for inflation essentially lessened the dollar effect. So the end result of 2 lakhs for 2008 that I suggested was just about 5% increase from the 2004 level of 1.89 lakhs.

The suggestion to apply the inflation % to the rupee value (1.89 lakhs) instead of the dollar value came up in the call. This made a lot of sense because we have now taken the dollar devaluation out of the picture. 

The amount we arrived at is Rs 2.3 lakhs using this approach. Please refer the last column in this spreadsheet for details regarding this. 

http://spreadsheets.google.com/pub?key=pVn5UG-nnr6eEWJ9OlDNQDQ

